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APAC-Central, Inc.
Fayetteville, AR 
Preston

479-788-6342

APAC-Central, Inc.
Fayetteville, AR 

Jenny Lind

479-788-6342

APAC-Central, Inc.

Fayetteville, AR 

Sharps 

479-788-6342

Asphalt Producers, LLC

Jonesboro, AR

Valley View

870-932-1306

Asphalt Producers, LLC
Jonesboro, AR
Portable Plant - Brinkley
870-932-1306

Asphalt Producers LLC
Jonesboro, AR
Walnut Ridge, AR 
870-932-1306

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. 
Batesville, AR
Batesville
870-251-2371

Did Not Bid This Contract

                            Code:  00-09

***See attached for Haul Prices

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2023 thru March 31, 2024                  Opening Date:  August 15, 2023

Bidders

145.00

***

***145.00

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-24-223W

Haul Price

Special Provision

High Performance Cold Mix Per Ton

***

190.00

115.00 .32/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

Tentatively Awarded By:  Purchasing Committee  8/25/2023                                     
Awarded To:                 ____As Per Tabulation                                              
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Atlas Asphalt, Inc. 
Batesville, AR
Mountain View
870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. 
Batesville, AR
Mountain Home
870-251-2371

Atlas Asphalt, Inc. 
Batesville, AR
Jonesboro, AR
870-251-2371

Blackstone Construction LLC
Russellville, AR
Russellville Plant 1
479-968-1149

Covington Enterprises, Inc.
Rogers, AR
Bentonville
479-621-9034

Cranford Construction Co.
N. Little Rock, AR
Dixon Road (Little Rock)
501-945-7176

Cranford Construction Co.
N. Little Rock, AR
Malvern - Jones Mill
501-945-7176

Did Not Bid This Contract

.32/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

.32/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

115.00

115.00

115.00 .32/tn per mile w/$4.00 min

ARDOT - High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-24-223W

Special Provision

Haul Price

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2023 thru March 31, 2024                  Opening Date:  August 15, 2023

High Performance Cold Mix Per Ton

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

Bidders

No Bid 140.00
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Cranford Construction Co.
N. Little Rock, AR
North Little Rock
501-945-7176

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.
Paragould, AR
Jonesboro, AR (Valley View) 
870-335-8209

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.
Paragould, AR
Judsonia
501-729-4601

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas, Inc.
Paragould, AR
Paragould 
870-206-2203

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Paragould, AR
Luxora
870-573-6882

Delta Asphalt of Arkansas
Paragould, AR
Black Rock
870-573-6882

Did Not Bid This Contract

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-24-223W

Haul Price

No Bid 

140.00

125.00

125.00

High Performance Cold Mix Per TonBidders

No Bid 

No Bid 

125.00

Special Provision

No Bid 

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2023 thru March 31, 2024                  Opening Date:  August 15, 2023
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Emery Sapp & Sons , Inc
Springdale, AR 
Gravette, AR 
479-295-2376

Emery Sapp & Sons , Inc

Springdale, AR 

Sonora, AR 

479-295-2376

Emery Sapp & Sons, Inc

Springdale, AR 

Berryville, AR 

870-423-1003

Hutchens Construction Co.
Cassville, MO
Sonora Plant, Springdale, AR
479-927-0257

Jay-Pac Inc.

Morrilton, AR

#1 Hixon Road, Plumerville, AR

501-354-4175

JoB Const. Co., Inc.
Poteau, OK 
Poteau, OK 
918-647-8284
918-721-1223
Lehman-Roberts Co. 
Memphis, TN
2360 West Belmont Circle, Memphis

901-327-3595

Did Not Bid This Contract

No Bid 

Special Provision

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION

Bidders

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2023 thru March 31, 2024                  Opening Date:  August 15, 2023

High Performance Cold Mix Per Ton Haul Price

120.00

ARDOT - High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-24-223W
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Lehman-Roberts Co. 
2840 Carrier Rd. 
Memphis, TN
901-482-1755

Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co.
Pine Bluff, AR
Monticello

870-541-8058

Pine Bluff Sand & Gravel Co.
Pine Bluff, AR
Kansas Street & River 

Pine Bluff
870-534-7122

R. K. Hall, LLC
Paris, TX
Texarkana, AR
903-782-6000

Rogers Group, Inc.
Conway, AR
Greenbrier
501-679-6230

Rogers Group, Inc.
Conway, AR
Gravette
479-298-0052

Did Not Bid This Contract

Date of Contract:  October 1, 2023 thru March 31, 2024                  Opening Date:  August 15, 2023

145.00 No Bid 

No Bid 150.00

High Performance Cold Mix Per Ton

Special Provision

Bidders Haul Price

ARKANSAS STATE HIGHWAY COMMISSION
ARDOT - High Performance Cold Mix Materials Supply Contract No. H-24-223W



Miles Per Ton Rate Miles Ton Rate
0-6 $5.00 31 $9.90
7-12 $5.55 32 $10.10
13 $5.85 33 $10.35
14 $6.05 34 $10.60
15 $6.25 35 $10.80
16 $6.50 36 $11.05
17 $6.65 37 $11.25
18 $6.90 38 $11.55
19 $7.15 39 $11.70
20 $7.35 40 $11.95
21 $7.60 41 $12.15
22 $7.85 42 $12.40
23 $8.05 43 $12.65
24 $8.30 44 $12.85
25 $8.55 45 $13.10
26 $8.75 46 $13.35
27 $9.00 47 $13.60
28 $9.25 48 $13.80
29 $9.50 49 $14.05
30 $9.70 50 $14.30

20 ton Minimum haul charge

APAC CENTRAL, INC.

DUMP TRUCK MILEAGE HAUL RATES

Effective: October 1, 2023 - March 31, 2024

Jenny Lind, Preston, Midland & Van Buren Sand Plant

51 Miles & Over 0.241 per ton mile

Add $1.00 per ton for Cold Mix or Hot Mix

Add $2.00 per ton for 18" Rip rap



MILES Rate

All locations $0.35

Note: All haul rate quotes are on a per-ton mile basis and are rounded 
to the nearest mile to the delivery site.

$3.00/ton minimum haul rate.
Add $1.00 per ton for asphalt
Add $2.00 per ton for 18" Rip rap

APAC CENTRAL, INC.

DUMP TRUCK MILEAGE HAUL RATES

Effective: October 1, 2023 - March 31, 2024
Sharps, Valley Springs, Hindsville, Avoca, Gravette & Bella Vista Plants


	Plant Mix Contract

